
 
 

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT 
WESTERN DISTRICT OF NORTH CAROLINA 

CHARLOTTE DIVISION 
 

Laura T. Beyer, Judge Presiding 
 

THURSDAY, JUNE 23, 2022  
 
9:30 a.m. 
 

1) 11 Bestwall LLC 17-31795 2nd continued status hearing on order 
granting debtor’s supplemental motion to 
enforce PIQ order with respect to non-
compliant claimants (2553, 2401, 2212); 
brief [Responding Claimants] (2616); 
debtor’s brief (2617); response [The 
Official Committee of Asbestos 
Claimants] (2618) 
 
Continued hearing on motion to 
reconsider order [The Official Committee 
of Asbestos Claimants and Future 
Claimants’ Representative] (2530, 2502); 
debtor’s response (2574); reply [The 
Official Committee of Asbestos Claimants 
and Future Claimants’ Representative] 
(2599)  
 
Hearing on debtor’s motion for (A) a 
protective order directing that it and its 
defense firms need not respond to 
overbroad and disproportionate document 
requests and (B) orders authorizing debtor 
to produce certain privileged documents 
without waiving privilege protection 
(2602) 
 
Hearing on motion for entry of an order (I) 
compelling the debtor to produce 
complete claim files, including 
electronically stored information, or, in the 
alternative, (II) issuing an adverse 
inference against the debtor (redacted) 
[The Official Committee of Asbestos 
Claimants and Future Claimants’ 
Representative] (2611) 
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CASSADA/ELLMAN/ERENS/ 
GORDON/HARRIS/SCHNEIDER/ 
THERRIAN/WORF 
GOODMAN/LABOVITZ/MILLER/TOMSIC 
HARRON/PARRISH/ZIEG/SPENCER 
RAMSEY/WRIGHT/THOMPSON/DANTINNE/SIMPSON 
EWING/RUBINSTEIN/HAGGERTY 
LYDAY/WALDREP/LANIK 
 
-----------  
 


